
TITLE 14 - ORDINANCE# 2022-0509 

TETON COUNTY WATERWAYS RECREATION ORDINANCE 

TETON COUNT�IDAHO 

Amended June 10, 2024 

AN ORDINANCE OF TETON COUNTY, IDAHO, TO BE ADMINISTERED AND 
ENFORCED BY THE TETON COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE AND/OR DESIGNATED 
COUNTY EMPLOYEES, AND TO BE KNOWN AS TETON COUNTY WATERWAYS 

RECREATION ORDINANCE, WITH COVERAGE OF DESIGNATED PORTIONS OF THE 
TETON RIVER AND ITS TRIBUTARIES WITHIN THE COUNTY, ESTABLISHING 
REGULATIONS FOR RECREATIONAL USE OF SAID AREA IN ORDER TO PRESERVE 
THE ECOLOGICAL HEALTH OF THESE WATERWAYS, MAINTAIN A QUALITY 
RECREATIONAL EXPERIENCE, AND TO PROVIDE FOR THE ECONOMIC 
WELL-BEING, HEALTH, SAFETY AND GENERAL WELFARE OF CITIZENS OF THE 
COUNTY. 

WHEREAS, the Teton County Board of Commissioners are granted general authority to enact 
the provisions of this chapter pursuant to the Idaho Constitution, Article XII, Section 2 and 
Idaho Code Section 31-714 and Section 31-807 giving counties authority to make and enforce 
ordinances for the protection of safety, health, and property within its limits in accordance with 
Idaho statute, and The Teton County Board of Commissioners is granted authority to regulate 
waterways pursuant to The Idaho Safe Boating Act, Idaho Code Title 67, Chapter 70 granting 
authority to political subdivisions to adopt ordinances with reference to the operation of vessels 
on any waterways within its territorial limits (Idaho Code Section 67-7031 ), and granting 
authority to appoint a waterways recreation advisory committee (Idaho Code Section 67-7012); 
and, 

WHEREAS, the Teton County Board of Commissioners has determined, through citizen reports, 
workshops, surveys, and consultation with officials at the Idaho Department of Fish and Game, 
Friends of the Teton River, Teton Regional Land Trust, Henry's Fork Foundation, Idaho Outfitters 
and Guides Licensing Board, and Idaho Outfitters & Guides Association, that it is in the best 
interests of the residents of Teton County to institute these regulations; and, 

WHEREAS, residents of Teton County desire to protect the area's natural environment, 
including the high-quality fresh waters of the Teton County waterways, recognizing that such 
outstanding natural attributes contribute to tourism, to the overall economic well-being, and to 
the quality of life enjoyed and appreciated by both residents and visitors alike; and, 




























